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the first director i worked with was imtiaz ali.
bollywood is not only known for its technicolor
colour films, it is notorious for being an
epicenter of nepotism. there is a spectrum of
nepotism in the film industry, where there is a
top tier made up of the big players, of course,
and then there is the top six where the
directors are picked based on who they have
worked with in the past (and who they know).
imitation is the highest form of flattery, and
imtiaz is a first-time director and he took to
hindi cinema, at that point of his career, in an
effort to land on that top tier. he wanted to
work with all of those bollywood biggies, to
prove that he was among the competition, to
be among the big boys. he was directed to
me. i had two years of experience in
mainstream hindi cinema. and i had worked
with probably around 20 national award
winning films in those two years. so, i was the
best bet that he could pick, i am the best bet
that he can work with. so he went to me and
of course, im always willing to direct a film.
but im home working on that. im trying to
finish marathi which i want to do because i
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love marathi, i am working on it and im really
glad that im also working on that part.
because, yes, im very young at this point in
my career, but i would love to work on my own
terms. when imtiaz came to me with wake up
sid, i had just come out with my book chaiyya
chaiyya. i had very few scripts to my name
and none that were really big. i have been at it
for ten years now. but just because of the
beauty of the script, i said, let me see what i
can do with this. and then it was a long
process of working on it. wake up sid, to me, is
the biggest challenge that i have ever been
given. i dont have a complex story to tell or
do. im just there to take you to very, very,
very, very deep waters.
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